—.. Betty Gonzalez
ﬁﬂ]] Purchasing Coordinator

|_I uriik | bgonzalez@turlock.ca.us
BID RESULTS BID NO. 16-355 TRAFFIC LINE PAINT, PAVEMENT MARKERS & MISC SUPPLIES
ITEM # Description Annual ENNIS PAINT, INC. INTERSTATE SALES
Quantity 12600 LOCKSLEY LANE SUITE 200
THOMASVILLE, NC 27360 AUBURN, CA 95602
(1) (2
55 Gallon Drum Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
1) Yellow 660 Gallons | $ 10.09 | $ 6,659.40 | $ 9.81|$ 6,474.60
2) White 495 Gallons $ 1080 | $ 5,346.00 | $ 9.81|$ 4,855.95
5 Gallon Buckets
3) Yellow 320 Gallons $ 10.28 | $ 3,289.60 | $ 10.10 | $ 3,232.00
4) White 480 Gallons $ 1099 | $ 5,275.20 | $ 10.10 | $ 4,848.00
5) Black 320 Gallons $ 1024 | $ 3,276.80 | $ 9.81|$ 3,139.20
6) Green / Blue 25 Gallons $ 11.89 | $ 297.25 | $ 13.80 | $ 345.00
7) Red 480 Gallons $ 1357 | $ 6,513.60 | $ 1340 $ 6,432.00
8) Stencil Coat 7075A 25 Gallons $ 9.50 [ $ 237.50 | $ 16.25 | $ 406.25
9) Bituminous Marker Adhesive 36 Boxes No Bid No Bid S 2145 | $ 772.20
Pavement Markers
10) Pavement Markers - Type "AY" 4,000 No Bid No Bid S 038 S 1,520.00
Other Misc Pavement Markers
11) Type "D" 1,000 No Bid No Bid $ 071 $ 710.00
12) Type "H" 1,000 No Bid No Bid S 071 $ 710.00
13) Type "A" 1,000 No Bid No Bid $ 071 $ 710.00
14) Type "G" 1,000 No Bid No Bid S 071 $ 710.00
SUBTOTAL| $ 30,895.35 $ 34,865.20
SALESTAX| § 2,355.77 S 2,658.47
FREIGHT

TOTAL| S 33,251.12 S 37,523.67




