
BID RESULTS BID NO. 16-326 FIRE SPRINKLERS AND SUPPRESSION INSPECTIONS AND REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE SERVICES
ITEM # Description Qty Jorgensen Fire Sppression Technologies, Inc.

❶ ❷ ❸

Building Annual Cost 5 Year Inspection Total Annual Cost 5 Year Inspection Total Annual Cost 5 Year Inspection Total 

1 City Hall Building 452.00$           938.00$           1,390.00$        248.00$           1,395.00$        1,643.00$        1,390.00$        1,210.00$        2,600.00$        

2 Public Safety Building 370.00$           955.00$           1,325.00$        248.00$           1,395.00$        1,643.00$        2,050.00$        1,760.00$        3,810.00$        

3 Fire/Police Training Building 247.00$           708.00$           955.00$           175.00$           695.00$           870.00$           1,170.00$        880.00$           2,050.00$        

4 CNG Building 247.00$           708.00$           955.00$           175.00$           695.00$           870.00$           1,170.00$        880.00$           2,050.00$        

5 Fire Station 1 247.00$           708.00$           955.00$           175.00$           695.00$           870.00$           1,170.00$        880.00$           2,050.00$        

Building Per Service X Total Bid Per Service X Total Bid Per Service X Total Bid

6 Senior Center - Hood 277.00$           2 554.00$           248.00$           2 496.00$           187.50$           2 375.00$           

7 Public Safety Building Clean Agent System 350.00$           2 700.00$           248.00$           2 496.00$           475.00$           2 950.00$           

8 City Hall Data Room Clean Agent System 350.00$           2 700.00$           248.00$           2 496.00$           350.00$           2 700.00$           

TOTAL BID 7,534.00$        7,384.00$        14,585.00$      

a) Technician Hourly Rate 105.00$           124.00$           110.00$           

b) Technician Hourly Overtime Rate 135.00$           164.00$           205.00$           

c) Parts Percentage Markup 30% 15% 10%

Addendum No, 1, 2 & 3 Submitted? Yes Addendum #3 not submitted

ITEM # Description Qty Siemens Industry, Inc. RCM Fire Protection, Inc. Intelli-Tech

❹ ❺ ❻
Building Annual Cost 5 Year Inspection Total Annual Cost 5 Year Inspection Total Annual Cost 5 Year Inspection Total 

1 City Hall Building 840.00$           1,850.00$        2,690.00$        3,103.00$        1,035.00$        4,138.00$        No Bid N/A

2 Public Safety Building 600.00$           1,320.00$        1,920.00$        4,140.00$        1,035.00$        5,175.00$        No Bid N/A

3 Fire/Police Training Building 240.00$           530.00$           770.00$           3,103.00$        1,035.00$        4,138.00$        No Bid N/A

4 CNG Building 240.00$           530.00$           770.00$           3,103.00$        1,035.00$        4,138.00$        No Bid N/A

5 Fire Station 1 360.00$           790.00$           1,150.00$        3,103.00$        1,035.00$        4,138.00$        No Bid N/A
Building Per Service X Total Bid Per Service X Total Bid Per Service X Total Bid

6 Senior Center - Hood 450.00$           2 900.00$           790.00$           2 1,580.00$        636.00$           2 1,272.00$        

7 Public Safety Building Clean Agent System 600.00$           2 1,200.00$        2,517.50$        2 5,035.00$        636.00$           2 1,272.00$        

8 City Hall Data Room Clean Agent System 600.00$           2 1,200.00$        2,645.00$        2 5,290.00$        636.00$           2 1,272.00$        

TOTAL BID 10,600.00$      33,632.00$      3,816.00$        

a) Technician Hourly Rate 128.00$           129.39$           159.00$           

b) Technician Hourly Overtime Rate 192.00$           172.34$           221.00$           

c) Parts Percentage Markup 20% 15% 20%

Addendum No, 1, 2 & 3 Submitted? Addendum 1, 2 & 3 not submitted Yes

12705 Bentley St, Waterford 

4273 W. Richert Ave, Fresno 350 Enterprise Place, Tracy 1031 Serpentine Lane, Pleasanton

Betty Gonzalez

Purchasing Coordinator

bgonzalez@turlock.ca.us

Addendum #3 not submitted

Yes

Exhibit D - Insurance Document not signed

4720 W. Jennifer Ave, Fresno

HCI Systems, Inc.

1536 Princeton Ave, Modesto


